

16-208  
EXHIBIT A

2016-2017

ROAD AND DITCH MAINTENANCE MATERIALS

RESOLUTION #2016-

<u>CATEGORY</u>	<u>TYPE/SIZE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>PRICE</u>
<b>BITUMINOUS MATERIALS</b> (PICKED UP PRICES) <u>PRICE PER TON</u>	#301 HOT MIX	PRIMARY - SHELLY MATERIALS SECONDARY - KENMORE CONSTRUCTION BACK-UP - TALLMADGE ASPHALT	\$39.60 ALL DISTRICTS \$43.00 ALL DISTRICTS \$47.25 ALL DISTRICTS
<b>B.O.C. #</b>	#404/#448 HOT MIX	PRIMARY - SHELLY MATERIALS SECONDARY - TALLMADGE ASPHALT BACK-UP - KENMORE CONSTRUCTION	\$44.89 ALL DISTRICTS \$51.00 ALL DISTRICTS \$52.00 ALL DISTRICTS
	SS-921/405	PRIMARY - D & R SUPPLY SECONDARY - HEI-WAY, LLC BACK-UP - TALLMADGE ASPHALT	\$75.00 ALL DISTRICTS \$100.16 ALL DISTRICTS \$110.00 ALL DISTRICTS
<b>LIMESTONE MATERIAL</b> (PICKED UP PRICES) <u>PRICE PER TON</u>	#1 & #2	NATIONAL LIME & STONE	\$17.75 ALL DISTRICTS
<b>B.O.C. #</b>	#4	NATIONAL LIME & STONE	\$17.75 ALL DISTRICTS
	#8	NATIONAL LIME & STONE	\$17.75 ALL DISTRICTS
	#57/#67	NATIONAL LIME & STONE	\$17.75 ALL DISTRICTS
	#304	NATIONAL LIME & STONE	\$15.25 ALL DISTRICTS
	ARMOR	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-A	NATIONAL LIME & STONE	\$39.00 ALL DISTRICTS
	#601-B	NATIONAL LIME & STONE	\$37.00 ALL DISTRICTS
	#601-C	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-D	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#9	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#9 WASHED	NATIONAL LIME & STONE	

EXHIBIT A  
ROAD AND DITCH MAINTENANCE MATERIALS

PAGE 2

<u>CATEGORY</u>	<u>TYPE/SIZE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>PRICE</u>
<b>LIMESTONE MATERIAL</b>			
<b>(DELIVERED PRICES)</b>			
<b>SOUTH DISTRICT</b>	#1 & #2	NO BID RECEIVED	
<b>PRICE PER TON</b>	#4	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#8	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#57/#67	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#304	NO BID RECEIVED	
	ARMOR	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-A	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-B	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-C	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-D	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#9	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#9 WASHED	NO BID RECEIVED	

EXHIBIT A  
ROAD AND DITCH MAINTENANCE MATERIALS

PAGE 3

<u>CATEGORY</u>	<u>TYPE/SIZE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>PRICE</u>
LIMESTONE MATERIAL (DELIVERED PRICES)	#1 & #2	NO BID RECEIVED	
NORTH DISTRICT PRICE PER TON	#4	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#8	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#57/#67	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#304	NO BID RECEIVED	
	ARMOR	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-A	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-B	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-C	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#601-D	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#9	NO BID RECEIVED	
	#9 WASHED	NO BID RECEIVED	

LIMESTONE MATERIAL (DELIVERED PRICES)	#1 & #2	NO BID RECEIVED
JOB SITE PRICE PER TON	#4	NO BID RECEIVED
	#8	NO BID RECEIVED
	#57/#67	NO BID RECEIVED
	#304	NO BID RECEIVED
	ARMOR	NO BID RECEIVED
	#601-A	NO BID RECEIVED
	#601-B	NO BID RECEIVED
	#601-C	NO BID RECEIVED
	#601-D	NO BID RECEIVED
	#9	NO BID RECEIVED
	#9 WASHED	NO BID RECEIVED